

IMPERIAL COUNTY SCHOOL FOOD SERVICE CO-OP
PRICE PROPOSAL SHEETS 2023 - 2024

Name of Vendor: Master List

SPEC No.	DESCRIPTION	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	Total Anticipated Co-Op Usage	Shamrock			Sysco			Gold Star			
				UNIT SIZE	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	PRODUCT NAME	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE
CEREAL													
1	Kellogge Asst. Jump Start Cereals (Reduced Sugars) (Must meet Whole Grain [WG] rich criteria) .75 oz to 1.5 oz Bowl Pk. Meets 1 oz. equivalent grain	44	3855	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		DISCONTINUED	DISCONTINUED				MFG DISC
2	Kelloggs Assorted Cereals (Must meet Whole Grain rich criteria) .75oz. To 1.5 oz. Bowl Pack Meets 1 oz. eq. grain	96	1685	1 bowl	32.11	0.33	96/1 OZ	\$ 30.23	\$ 0.31580	0.75OZ	KELLOGGS, CORN FLAKES CEREAL (PLEASE SEE ATTACHED ASSORTED FLAVORS)	\$ 32.02	\$ 0.3335
3	General Mills Assorted Cereals (Must meet Whole Grain rich criteria) .75oz. To 1.5 oz. Bowl Pack Meets 1 oz. eq. grain	96	885	1 OZ	30.68	0.32	96/1 OZ	\$ 28.47	\$ 0.29656	1OZ	GENERAL MILLS, CEREAL CINN TOAST CRUNCH WG (PLEASE SEE ATTACHED ASSORTED FLAVORS)	\$ 30.90	\$ 0.3219
4	Kellogge Asst. Jump Start Cereals (Must meet Whole Grain rich criteria) LOW SUGAR. 75 oz to 1.5 oz Bowl Pk. Meets 1 oz. eq. grain	44	3855	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		DISCONTINUED					MFG DISC
5	Kelloggs Assorted Cereals (Must meet Whole Grain rich criteria) LOW SUGAR. 75 oz to 1.5 oz Bowl Pk. Meets 1 oz. eq. grain	96	2440	1 bowl	32.11	0.33	96/1 OZ	\$ 29.89	\$ 0.31135	1OZ	KELLOGGS, CEREAL BOWL APPLE JACKS RS WG (PLEASE SEE ATTACHED ASSORTED FLAVORS)	\$ 31.47	\$ 0.3278
6	General Mills Assorted Cereals (Must meet Whole Grain rich criteria) LOW SUGAR. 75 oz to 1.5 oz Bowl Pk. Meets 1 oz. eq. grain	96	3650	1.06 OZ	30.68	0.32	96/1 OZ	\$ 28.47	\$ 0.29656	1OZ	GENERAL MILLS, BOWL 25% LSS CINN TST CRNCH WG (PLEASE SEE ATTACHED ASSORTED FLAVORS)	\$ 30.90	\$ 0.3219
7	Grain rich criteria) Meets 2 oz. eq. grains	60	880	2 OZ	37.84	0.63	60/2 OZ	\$ 34.88	\$ 0.58133	2OZ	COCOA PUFFS CUP FLAVORS)	\$ 38.11	\$ 0.6352
CEREAL BARS (NO TRANS FATS AND MUST MEET WHOLE GRAIN RICH CRITERIA)													
8	Chewy Cereal Bar Made W/Cocoa Puffs (Must meet WG rich criteria) Meets 1 oz. equivalent grain	96	1160	1.42 OZ	33.80	0.35	96/1.42 oz	\$ 30.14	\$ 0.31395	1.42OZ	GENERAL MILLS, BAR CEREAL COCOA PUFFS IW	\$ 33.73	\$ 0.3514
9	Chewy Cereal Bar Made W/Fruity Cheerios (Must meet WG rich criteria) Meets 1 oz. equivalent grain	96	950	1.42 OZ	33.95	0.35		discontinued		1.42OZ	GENERAL MILLS, BAR CEREAL TEAM CHEERIOS STRWBRY IW	\$ 33.73	\$ 0.3514
10	Chewy Cereal Bar Made W/Trix (Must meet WG rich criteria) Meets 1 oz. equivalent grain	96	770	1.42 OZ	33.95	0.35	96/1.42 oz	\$ 30.14	\$ 0.31395	1.42OZ	GENERAL MILLS, BAR CEREAL TRIX IW	\$ 33.73	\$ 0.3514
11	Chewy Cereal Bar W/Cinn Toast Square (Must meet WG rich criteria) Meets 1 oz. equivalent grain	96	750	1.42 OZ	33.95	0.35	96/1.42 oz	\$ 30.14	\$ 0.31395	1.42OZ	GENERAL MILLS, BAR CEREAL CINN TOAST CRUNCH IW	\$ 33.73	\$ 0.3514
12	Oatmeal Bar, IW 1.24 oz (Must meet WG rich criteria) Meets 1 oz. equivalent grain	144	685	1.24 OZ	52.44	0.36	144/1.24 oz	\$ 46.35	\$ 0.3219				
13	Granola Bar (Grain Cereal Bar) (Must meet WG rich criteria) Meets 1 oz. equivalent grain	144	630	.74 OZ	30.93	0.21	144/.8 oz	\$ 27.49	\$ 0.19090	.74OZ	NATURE VALLEY, OATS'N HONEY BAR	\$ 30.73	\$ 0.2134
14	GRANOLA LOW FAT WG CLUSTER CEREAL KELLOGS Meets 2 oz. equivalent grain	48 2 OZ	280	2 OZ	32.28	0.67	48/2 oz	\$ 25.64	\$ 0.5342	2OZ	KELLOGGS, POUCH GRANOLA CLUSTER LF WG	\$ 26.94	\$ 0.5613
15	UBR ULTIMATE BREAKFAST ROUND WG Meets 2 oz. equivalent grain	126 2.2 OZ	150	2.2 OZ	63.86	0.51	126/2.2 oz	\$ 58.65	\$ 0.4655	2.2OZ	RICHS, ULTIMATE BRKFST ROUND CINN IW	\$ 62.92	\$ 0.4994
16	Nutri Grain Bar (Must meet WG rich criteria) Meets 1 oz. equivalent grain	144	850	1.55 OZ	37.27	0.39	96/1.55 oz	\$ 33.25	\$ 0.3464				
17	Whole Grain Rich Fieldstone Granola Packet Meets 1 oz. equivalent grain	144	630	1 OZ	55.76	0.39	144/1 oz	\$ 51.76	\$ 0.3594	1OZ	FIELDSTONE, ORIGINAL GRANOLA IW	\$ 54.93	\$ 0.3815
DAIRY													
18	Milk Chocolate UHT Fat Free Shelf Stable	27 8 oz.	655	8 OZ	16.07	0.60	27/8 oz	\$ 10.85	\$ 0.4019	8OZ	GOSSNER, FAT FREE CHOCOLATE MILK	\$ 13.10	\$ 0.4852
19	Milk White UHT 1% Shelf Stable	27 8 oz.	540	8 OZ	15.28	0.57	27/8 oz	\$ 10.05	\$ 0.3722	8OZ	GOSSNER, 1% WHITE MILK	\$ 12.47	\$ 0.4619
20	Cheese American Sliced 100	4 5 lb.	980				4/5 LB	\$ 39.95	\$ 9.9875	5LB	BONGARDS, CHEESE AMER YELLOW RF LS	\$ 57.51	\$ 14.3775
21	Cheese String 1 oz. IW Pasteurized Part Skim Mozzarella	168	1676	1 OZ	46.85	0.28	168/1OZ	\$ 38.59	\$ 0.22970	1OZ	LAND O LAKES, LITE MOZZ STRING CHEESE IW	\$ 39.35	\$ 0.2342
22	General Mills Yoplait Trix Yogurt 4oz All Flavors Grade A Low Fat	48	2420	4 OZ	15.54	0.32	48/4 oz	\$ 14.21	\$ 0.2960	4OZ	YOPLAIT, YOGURT TRIX (SEE ATTACHED FLAVORS)	\$ 16.38	\$ 0.3413
23	Dannon Danimals Yogurt 4oz All Flavors Grade A Low Fat	48	3120	4 OZ	15.46	0.32	48/4 oz	\$ 11.49	\$ 0.23938	4OZ	NF CUP (SEE ATTACHED FLAVORS)	\$ 13.58	\$ 0.2829

IMPERIAL COUNTY SCHOOL FOOD SERVICE CO-OP
PRICE PROPOSAL SHEETS 2023 - 2024

Name of Vendor: Master List

SPEC No.	DESCRIPTION	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	Total Anticipated Co-Op Usage	Shamrock			Sysco			Gold Star			
				UNIT SIZE	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	PRODUCT NAME	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE
24	Dannon Activia Yogurt 4oz All Flavors Grade A Low Fat	24	380	4 OZ	11.22	0.47	24/4 oz	\$ 9.92	\$ 0.41333	4OZ	DANNON COMPANY INC, ACTIVIA (SEE ATTACHED FLAVORS)	\$ 11.11	\$ 0.4629
25	3009911 6 pack 106 oz pouch Must Meet 1 MMA per 3 oz serving.	6 106 oz.	200	106 OZ	72.31	12.05	6/106 oz	\$ 72.43	\$ 12.0717	106OZ	LAND O LAKES, CHEESE YELLOW SAUCE POUCH	\$ 77.14	\$ 12.8567
26	Nacho Cheese Sauce Lite Jalapeño #6 10	6#10	336	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	6/106 oz	\$ 72.52	\$ 12.0867	106OZ	LAND O LAKES, CHEESE JALAPENO SAUCE POUCH	\$ 77.23	\$ 12.8717
27	Nacho Cheese Shelf Stable- CHEDDAR 3 oz Portion Cup	140	265	3 OZ	81.75	0.58	140/3 oz	\$ 82.51	\$ 0.58936	3OZ	LAND O LAKES, ULT CHEDDAR CHS DIP CUPS	\$ 87.75	\$ 0.6268
28	Nacho Cheese Shelf Stable- JALAPENO 3 oz Portion Cup	140	205	3 OZ	81.75	0.58	140/3 oz	\$ 82.51	\$ 0.58936	3OZ	LAND O LAKES, MUCHO QUESO JALP CHS CUPS	\$ 87.75	\$ 0.6268
29	Flavors	6/4lb	350	4 LB	32.52 32.46	5.42 5.41	6/4 LB	\$ 28.74	\$ 4.79	4LB	YOPLAIT, YOGURT LF PARFAIT PRO (SEE ATTACHED FLAVORS)	\$ 32.95	\$ 5.4917

SNACKS SB12 COMPLIANT

30	rich criteria) 1.75 oz Meets 1 oz. equivalent grain	60	150	1.75 OZ	26.55	0.44	60/1.75 oz	\$ 23.29	\$ 0.38817	1.75OZ	GENERAL MILLS, CHEX MIX CHEDDAR W/PRETZELS	\$ 26.14	\$ 0.4357
31	criteria) 1.75 oz Meets 1.75 oz. equivalent grain	60	240	1.75 OZ	26.71	0.45	60/1.75 oz	\$ 23.44	\$ 0.39067	1.75OZ	GENERAL MILLS, CHEX MIX TRADITIONAL WG	\$ 26.30	\$ 0.4383
32	criteria) 1.75 oz Meets 1.25 oz. equivalent grain	60	125	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	60/1.75 oz	DISC.				MFG DISC	
33	Simply Chex-Cheddar (Must meet WG rich criteria) 1.25 oz Meets .5 oz equivalent grain	60	215	.92 OZ	28.41	0.47	60/.92 oz	\$ 22.70	\$ 0.37833	.92OZ	GENERAL MILLS, SIMPLY CHEX SNACK CHEDDAR WG	\$ 25.47	\$ 0.4245
34	Simply Chex-Chocolate Caramel (Must meet WG rich criteria) 1.2 oz Must meet 1 oz. equivalent grain	60	235	1.03 OZ	28.41	0.47	60/1.03 oz	\$ 22.70	\$ 0.37833	1.03OZ	GENERAL MILLS, SIMPLY CHEX CHC CARAMEL MX WG	\$ 25.47	\$ 0.4245
35	Simply Chex-Strawberry Yogurt (Must meet WG rich criteria) 1.2 oz Meets 1 oz equivalent grain	60	225	1.03 OZ	25.87	0.43	60/1.03 oz	\$ 22.70	\$ 0.37833	1.03OZ	GENERAL MILLS, SIMPLY CHEX STRBRY YGRM MIX WG	\$ 25.47	\$ 0.4245
36	meet WG rich criteria) .875 oz Meets 1 oz equivalent grain	104	585	0.9 OZ	40.40	0.39	104/.875 oz	\$ 37.03	\$ 0.35606	.875OZ	QUAKER, MUNCHIE MIX KID'S	\$ 40.45	\$ 0.3889
37	Fruit Flavored Snack (rolled-up by the foot) standards	96	295	24 pack	26.01	6.50	96/5 oz	\$ 23.24	\$ 0.24208	.5OZ	GENERAL MILLS, FRUIT ROLL-UP (SEE ATTACHED FLAVORS)	\$ 25.62	\$ 0.2669
38	criteria) Meets 1 oz. eq. grain	96	270	96/1.42/OZ	33.80	0.35		DISC.					
39	Rice Krispies Treats, mini bars (Must meet WG rich criteria) Meets .25 oz. eq. grain	600	285	0.39 OZ	102.60	0.17	600/.42 oz	\$ 96.12	\$ 0.16020			MFG DISC	
40	criteria) Meets 1 oz. eq. grain	80	310	1.59 OZ	38.87	0.49	80/1.59 oz	\$ 34.72	\$ 0.43400	1.59OZ	KELLOGGS, RICE KRISPIES CHOC CHIP WG	\$ 36.83	\$ 0.4604
41	Mini Donuts, WG, Chocolate Enrobed, 6 pack Meets 2 oz gran equivalent	72	555	3.3 OZ	75.25	1.05	72/3.2 oz	\$ 69.73	\$ 0.96847	3.2OZ	BAKE CRAFTERS, DONUT CHOCOLATE WG IW	\$ 69.41	\$ 0.9640
42	Mini Donuts, WG, Powdered Sugar, 6 pack Meets 2 oz gran equivalent	72	605	3 OZ	87.64	0.94	72/3.2 oz	\$ 58.40	\$ 0.81111	3.2OZ	BAKE CRAFTERS, DONUT POWDERED SUGAR WG	\$ 57.95	\$ 0.8049
43	Chocolate Éclair Bar, Blue Ribbon Classics	144	80	24 PK	72.67	12.11		NO BID				NO BID	
44	Fudge Bar, Blue Ribbon Classics	48	187	24 PK	22.01	11.00		NO BID				NO BID	
45	Orange Dream Bar, Blue Ribbon Classics	48	167	24 PK	22.01	11.00		NO BID				NO BID	
46	Low Fat Vanilla Fudge Swirl Ice Cream Cone, Blue Ribbon Classics	48	210	6/8/PK	36.53	6.09		NO BID				NO BID	
47	Low Fat Cookies 'n Cream Ice Cream Cone, Blue Ribbon Classics	48	180	6/8/PK	36.53	6.09		NO BID				NO BID	
48	SideKicks, Smooth-Frozen (Assorted Flavors) 1/2 cup Fruit	84	2430	4.4 OZ	37.04	0.44		NO BID		4.4OZ	SIDEKICK (SEE ATTACHED FLAVORS)	\$ 32.00	\$ 0.3810
52	Pre-Baked, Soft Pretzels 2.5oz 2 grain equivalent	100	325	100/2.2/OZ	35.91	0.36	100/2.2 oz	\$ 23.80	\$ 0.2380	2.2OZ	J & J SNACK FOODS, SUPERPRETZEL BKD 51% WG	\$ 26.94	\$ 0.3207
53	Sunrich LLC, Sunflower Seed Kernel, Blazin' Hot 1 oz equivalent MMA	150	410	1.2 OZ	44.69	0.30		NO BID		1.2OZ	SUNOPTA, BLAZN HOT SUNFLOWER KERNELS IW	\$ 44.02	\$ 0.5240

IMPERIAL COUNTY SCHOOL FOOD SERVICE CO-OP
PRICE PROPOSAL SHEETS 2023 - 2024

Name of Vendor: Master List

SPEC No.	DESCRIPTION	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	Total Anticipated Co-Op Usage	Shamrock			Sysco			Gold Star			
				UNIT SIZE	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	PRODUCT NAME	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE
BAKED CHIPS - SINGLE SERVE (NO TRANS FATS AND MUST MEET WHOLE GRAIN RICH CRITERIA)													
54	Hot and Spicy Fries - Baked (Must meet WG rich criteria) .75 oz Bag Meets 1 oz. equivalent grain	104	265	1 OZ	40.88	0.39				10Z	CHEETOS, FANTASTIX FLAMIN' HOT WG	\$ 40.45	\$ 0.3889
55	1 oz Bag Meets 1 oz equivalent grain criteria)	72	905	1 OZ	28.17	0.39	72/1 oz	\$ 25.44	\$ 0.35333	10Z	DORITOS, TORTILLA CHIP RF WG (SEE ATTACHED FLAVORS)	\$ 27.99	\$ 0.3888
56	1 oz Bag Meets 1 oz equivalent grain rich criteria)	104	745	1 OZ	40.70	0.39	104/1 oz	\$ 37.03	\$ 0.35606	10Z	SUN CHIPS, SNACKS ORIGINAL MULTIGRAIN WG	\$ 40.45	\$ 0.3889
57	1 oz Bag Meets 1 oz equivalent grain meet WG rich criteria)	104	410	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	104/1 oz	DISC.				MFG DISC	
58	1 oz Bag Meets 1 oz equivalent grain WG rich Criteria)	104	745	1 OZ	40.70	0.39	104/1 oz	\$ 37.03	\$ 0.35606	10Z	SUN CHIPS, MULTIGRAIN HARVEST CHEDDAR WG	\$ 40.45	\$ 0.3889
59	1 oz Bag Meets 1 oz equivalent grain	104	795	1 OZ	40.70	0.39	104/1 oz	\$ 37.03	\$ 0.35606	10Z	SUN CHIPS, CHIPS MULTIGRAIN GARDEN SALSA WG	\$ 40.45	\$ 0.3889
60	Chips Corn Tortilla IW (Must meet WG rich criteria) Min 2.0 oz Round Meet 2 oz equivalent grain	100	812	1.45 OZ	37.10	0.58	60/2 oz	\$ 20.69	\$ 0.34483				
61	Walking Taco Fito Corn Chips 1.5 oz bag meets 2 oz grain equivalent	60	405	1.5 OZ	32.81	0.55	60/1.5 oz	\$ 30.58	\$ 0.50967	1.50Z	FRITO LAY, CHIPS WALKING TACO FRITOS	\$ 33.51	\$ 0.5585
62	TOSTITOS BAKED Meets 1.25 oz. equivalent grain	72	873	0.88 OZ	26.72	0.37	72/875 oz	\$ 24.09	\$ 0.33458	.875OZ	TOSTITOS, SCOOPS BAKED TOSTITO WG	\$ 26.55	\$ 0.3688
63	Hot Cheetos Baked (Must meet WG rich criteria) 1 oz Bag Meets 1 oz equivalent grain	64	920	0.9 OZ	40.40	0.39	64 / 1.5 OZ	\$ 37.32	\$ 0.58313				
64	Baked BBQ Potato Chips, Lays (Must meet WG rich criteria) 1 oz Bag Meets 1 oz equivalent grain	64	455	0.88 OZ	23.59	0.39	64 / 1.125Z	\$ 33.82	\$ 0.52844				
65	Baked Original Potato Chips, Lays (Must meet WG rich criteria) 1 oz Bag Meets 1 oz equivalent grain	64	430	0.88 OZ	23.59	0.39	64 / 1.125Z	\$ 33.82	\$ 0.52844				
66	Baked Sour Cream Onion Potato Chips, Lays (Must meet WG rich criteria) 1 oz Bag Meets 1 oz equivalent grain	64	312	0.88 OZ	23.59	0.39	64 / 1.125Z	\$ 33.82	\$ 0.52844				
CRACKERS/COOKIES (NO TRANS FATS AND MUST MEET WHOLE GRAIN RICH CRITERIA)													
67	Crackers, Animal (Must meet WG rich criteria) 1 oz to 1.5 oz Meet 1 oz equivalent grain	100	530	1 OZ	39.83	0.27		DISC.					
68	Crackers, Honey Graham 3 Pack IW (Must meet WG rich criteria) Variety Flavors Must Meet 1 oz equivalent grain	150	765	3 PK	23.37	0.16	150 / 3 CT	\$ 18.78	\$ 0.12520	3PK	MJM MARKETING, GRAHAMS/W FIBER HONEY WG IW	\$ 23.48	\$ 0.1565
69	1 oz to 1.5 oz Must Meet 1 oz equivalent grain	150	760	150/1/OZ	35.91	0.24	150 / 1 OZ	\$ 32.89	\$ 0.21927				
70	Graham Cookies Kelloggs Bug Bites (Must meet WG rich criteria) 1 oz to 1.5 oz Must Meet 1 oz equivalent grain	210	760	1.1 OZ	55.06	0.26	210 / 1 OZ	\$ 48.87	\$ 0.23271	10Z	KEEBLER, CINNAMON GRAHAM BUG BITE IW	\$ 51.53	\$ 0.2454
71	CHEWY OATMEAL BITES BACK PACKERS - VARIETY Meets 1 oz. equivalent grain	36	1285	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		DISC.					
73	criteria) .75 oz. Must Meet 1 oz equivalent grain	300	670	0.75 OZ	67.65	0.23	300 / .75 OZ	\$ 62.99	\$ 0.20997	.75OZ	PEPPERIDGE FARM, CRACKERS GOLDFISH CHEDDAR WG	\$ 66.65	\$ 0.2222
74	Meets 1 oz. eq. grain	150	670	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				.9OZ	KELLOGGS, KEEBLER GRIPZ CINN GRAHAM IW	\$ 40.63	\$ 0.2709
75	rich criteria) Meets 1 oz. eq. grain	210	880	1 OZ	55.06	0.26	210 / 1 OZ	\$ 49.89	\$ 0.23757	10Z	KEEBLER, SCOOPY DOO GRAHAM STIX IW	\$ 52.51	\$ 0.2500
76	Cheez It Cracker (Must meet WG rich criteria) 0.75oz Meets 1 oz. eq. grain	175	698	0.75 OZ	43.89	0.25	175 / .75 OZ	\$ 37.26	\$ 0.21291	.75OZ	KELLOGGS, CRACKER CHEEZ-IT WG IW	\$ 39.30	\$ 0.2246
77	Zesta Saltine, Mini Crackers, (Must meet WG rich criteria) Meets .5 oz. eq. grain	300	109	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						MFG DISC	
78	Kellogg's, Chat Snack, Vanilla Crunch Meets 1 oz. eq. grain	210	170	1 OZ	55.06	0.26		NO BID		10Z	KELLOGGS, GRAHAMS VANILLA CHATSNAX	\$ 52.40	\$ 0.2495
BREAKFAST BREADS & BREAD ALTERNATES FROZEN (NO TRANS FATS AND MUST MEET WHOLE GRAIN RICH CRITERIA)													
79	Biscuits, Fully Baked Frozen 2.25oz (Must meet WG rich criteria) Whole Grain Content	120	310	2.25 OZ	39.11	0.27	144 / 2.25OZ	\$ 36.63	\$ 0.25438	2.25OZ	PILLSBURY, BISCUIT BAKED EASY SPLIT RS	\$ 36.11	\$ 0.3009

IMPERIAL COUNTY SCHOOL FOOD SERVICE CO-OP
PRICE PROPOSAL SHEETS 2023 - 2024

Name of Vendor: Master List

SPEC No.	DESCRIPTION	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	Total Anticipated Co-Op Usage	Shamrock			Sysco			Gold Star			
				UNIT SIZE	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	PRODUCT NAME	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE
80	Concha (Must meet WG rich criteria)		330	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	84 / 2.25OZ	\$ 44.11	\$ 0.52512				
81	Churro Raspberry Filled (Must meet WG rich criteria)									1.91OZ	J & J SNACK FOODS, 51% CHURROS 5" RSPBRY FILLD WG	\$ 26.94	\$ 0.2694
	Whole Grain Content Pre Cooked 6"	100	235	100 PK	27.36	27.36	100 / 5"	\$ 26.47	\$ 0.26470				
	Dough, Cinn Swirl Roll WG	140								2.6OZ	RICHES, DOUGH CINNAMON SWIRL WG	\$ 49.38	\$ 0.3527
82	Meets - 2 oz. equivalent grain	2.6 oz	285	2.6 OZ	50.13	0.36		NO BID					
	ICEING, VANILLA HEAT N ICE	1								0	RICHES, ICING VANILLA HEAT 'N ICE	\$ 28.94	\$ 28.9400
83	RICHES - FRZN DESSERT TOPPING	12 LB TUB	96	12 LB	30.42	30.42		NO BID					
	French Toast Sticks Fully Cooked (Must meet WG rich criteria)												
84	Whole Grain Content	10#	1145	5 LB	25.20	12.60	12 / 2LB	\$ 52.06	\$ 2.1692				
	Pancakes Frozen Fully Cooked BULK (Must meet WG rich criteria)									1.3OZ	BAKE CRAFTERS, PANCAKE BUTTERMILK BULK WG	\$ 27.55	\$ 0.1913
85	Whole Grain Content Aprox 1.3oz/4-1/2 "	144	525	1.2 OZ	29.95	0.21	144 / 1.4OZ	\$ 35.05	\$ 0.24340				
	Brand												
86	Whole Grain Content 4 Count per Pkg	72	795	3.03 OZ	34.83	0.48	72 / 3.03OZ	\$ 32.66	\$ 0.45361				
	Soft Filled Pastry, Cocoa Puffs (Must meet WG rich criteria)									2.43OZ	PILLSBURY, BAR SOFT FILLED COCOA PUFFS IW	\$ 38.15	\$ 0.5299
87	Whole Grain Content 2 oz equivalent Grains		510	2.43 OZ	38.23	0.53	72 / 2.43OZ	\$ 37.80	\$ 0.52500				
	criteria)									2.36OZ	PILLSBURY, TST CRNCH SOFT FILLED CINN IW	\$ 38.15	\$ 0.5299
88	Whole Grain Content 2 oz equivalent Grains		545	2.36 OZ	38.23	0.53	72 / 2.36OZ	\$ 37.80	\$ 0.52500				
	Waffle Stix Fully Cooked Bulk (Must meet WG rich criteria)												
89	Whole Grain Content Aprox 1 oz equivalent grain	144	310	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	216/ 77 OZ	\$ 49.91	\$ 0.23106				
	rich criteria)									2.64OZ	EGGO, WAFFLE MINI WG IW (SEE ATTACHED FLAVORS)	\$ 34.76	\$ 0.4828
90	Whole Grain Content 1 oz equivalent grain	72	1105	2.4 OZ	48.49	0.51		NO BID					
	Muffins All flavors, IW 1.8 oz. (Must meet WG rich criteria)												
92	Snack Requirements	60	1395	1.9 OZ	34.18	0.38		NO BID					
	Muffins All flavors, IW 3 oz. (Must meet WG rich criteria)				32.23	0.67							
95	Whole Grain Content (2 oz. eq. grain)	40	1440	3.6 OZ	32.23	0.67	48 / 3.1 OZ	\$ 25.99	\$ 0.54146				
	WG rich criteria)												
96	Meets 2 oz. eq. grain	100	525	1.7 OZ	39.90	0.40	100 / 1.76OZ	\$ 35.40	\$ 0.354	1.7OZ	KELLOGGS, CRUNCHMANIA CINN BUNS IW	\$ 38.18	\$ 0.3818
	WG rich criteria)												
97	Meets 2 oz. eq. grain	100	420	1.7 OZ	39.90	0.40	100 / 1.76OZ	\$ 35.40	\$ 0.354			MFG DISC	
	Mini Breakfast Bun Bites (Must meet WG rich criteria)	72								2.75OZ	SKY BLUE FOODS, BREAKFAST CLUSTER MINI WG	\$ 41.00	\$ 0.5694
98	Meets 2 oz. eq. grain	2.75 oz	345					NO BID					
	Mini Cinnis (Must meet WG rich criteria)	72								2.29OZ	PILLSBURY, ROLLS MINI CINNIS CINNMN WG IW	\$ 38.15	\$ 0.5299
99	Meets 2 oz. eq. grain	2.29 oz	1010	2.29 OZ	38.23	0.53	72 / 2.29OZ	\$ 37.58	\$ 0.52194				
	criteria)									2.5OZ	J & J SNACK FOODS, BENEFIT BRKFST BAR OAT/CHOC IW	\$ 20.48	\$ 0.4267
100	Meets 2 oz. eq. grain	48	2270	2.5 OZ	20.62	0.43	48 / 2.5 OZ	\$ 19.58	\$ 0.40792				
	WG rich criteria)				22.04	0.46				1.76OZ	KELLOGGS, POPTART STRAWBRY FRSTD 1 CT WG	\$ 44.12	\$ 0.3677
101	Meets 1 oz. eq. grain	120	405	10 PK	47.25	3.94	120 / 1.69OZ	\$ 41.58	\$ 0.34650				
	WG rich criteria)									1.76OZ	KELLOGGS, POPTART CINN FRSTD 1CT WG	\$ 44.12	\$ 0.3677
102	Meets 1.25 oz. eq. grain	120	250	10 PK	47.25	0.39	120 / 1.69OZ	\$ 41.58	\$ 0.34650				
	rich criteria)									1.76OZ	KELLOGGS, POPTART FUDGE 1CT WG	\$ 44.12	\$ 0.3677
103	Meets 1.25 oz. eq. grain	120	170	1.76 OZ	47.25	0.39	120 / 1.76OZ	\$ 41.58	\$ 0.34650				
	WG rich criteria)									3.53OZ	KELLOGGS, POPTART STRAWBERRY FRSTD 2CT WG IW	\$ 39.17	\$ 0.5440
104	Meets 2.25 oz. eq. grain	72	230	6 PK	42.12	3.51	72 / 3.53OZ	\$ 35.86	\$ 0.49806				
	WG rich criteria)									3.53OZ	KELLOGGS, POPTART CINN FROSTED 2CT WG IW	\$ 39.17	\$ 0.5440
105	Meets 2.5 oz. eq. grain	72	270	10 PK	42.12	3.51	72 / 3.53OZ	\$ 35.86	\$ 0.49806				
	rich criteria)									3.53OZ	KELLOGGS, POPTART FUDGE FRSTD 2CT WG IW	\$ 39.17	\$ 0.5440
106	Meets 2.25 oz. eq. grain	72	110	3.53 OZ	42.12	0.59	72 / 3.52OZ	\$ 35.86	\$ 0.49806				
FRUIT/VEGETABLE													
107	Juice Apple Frozen 4 oz. US Grade A Pasteurized	70	7195	4 OZ	10.69	0.15	70 / 4 OZ	\$ 10.24	\$ 0.14629	4OZ	SUNCUP, 100% APPLE JUICE W/WIT C	\$ 11.85	\$ 0.1693
	Juice Grape Frozen 4 oz. US Grade A Pasteurized	70	4450	4 OZ	12.67	0.18	70 / 4 OZ	\$ 12.24	\$ 0.17486	4OZ	SUNCUP, 100% GRAPE JUICE W/WIT C	\$ 13.97	\$ 0.1996
	Juice Orange Frozen 4 oz. US Grade A Pasteurized	70	6380	4 OZ	14.40	0.21	70 / 4 OZ	\$ 13.92	\$ 0.19886	4OZ	SUNCUP, 100% ORANGE JUICE	\$ 15.58	\$ 0.2226

IMPERIAL COUNTY SCHOOL FOOD SERVICE CO-OP
PRICE PROPOSAL SHEETS 2023 - 2024

Name of Vendor: Master List

SPEC No.	DESCRIPTION	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	Total Anticipated Co-Op Usage	Shamrock			Sysco			Gold Star			
				UNIT SIZE	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	PRODUCT NAME	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE
110	Juice Apple Frozen 6 oz. US Grade A Pasteurized	70	1600	6 OZ	13.24 13.38	0.19 0.19	70 / 6 OZ	\$ 12.87	\$ 0.18386	6OZ	SUNCUP, 100% APPLE JUICE W/UIT C	\$ 14.94	\$ 0.2134
111	Juice Grape Frozen 6 oz. US Grade A Pasteurized	70	1180	6 OZ	16.34	0.23	70 / 6 OZ	\$ 15.86	\$ 0.22657	6OZ	SUNCUP, 100% GRAPE JUICE W/UIT C	\$ 18.12	\$ 0.2589
112	Juice Orange Frozen 6 oz. US Grade A Pasteurized	70	1630	6 OZ	16.58 14.49	0.24 0.21	70 / 6 OZ	\$ 16.10	\$ 0.23000	6OZ	SUNCUP, 100% ORANGE JUICE	\$ 18.38	\$ 0.2626
113	Cool Tropics RIPS Slush 100% Juice 1/2 cup Fruit Equivalent	60 PK	400	4 OZ	29.00 24.63	0.48 0.41		NO BID		4OZ	COOL TROPICS, JUICE SLUSH (SEE ATTACHED FLAVORS)	\$ 23.51	\$ 0.3918
114	JUICY JUICE BOX 100% JUICE Meets - 3/4 cup fruit serving	8ct 6.75 oz	695	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		NO BID					
115	Apple and Eve - Variety Meets 4. fl oz. - 3/4 cup fruit serving	40 4.23 oz	7010	4.23 OZ	8.36 8.36	0.21 0.21	40/4.23 oz	\$ 8.25	\$ 0.20625	4.23OZ	APPLE AND EVE, JUICE (SEE ATTACHED FLAVORS)	\$ 8.29	\$ 0.2073
116	Apple and Eve - Variety Meets 6.75 fl oz. - 3/4 cup fruit serving	36 6.75 fl oz.	2195	6.75 OZ	11.91	0.33	36/6.75 oz	\$ 10.16	\$ 0.28222	6.75OZ	APPLE AND EVE, JUICE 100% (SEE ATTACHED FLAVORS)	\$ 10.00	\$ 0.2778
117	Applesauce Cupped - 4.5 oz. (Must meet 1/2 cup fruit criteria) Pasteurized- ORIGINAL	96	435	4.5 OZ	35.54	0.37	72/4 OZ	\$ 25.41	\$ 0.35292				
118	CRAISINS DRIED CRANBERRIES (ASSORTED FLAVORS) Meets 1.16 oz - 1/2 cup fruit	200 1.16 oz.	945	1.16 OZ	48.81	0.24	200 / 1.16OZ	\$ 46.13	\$ 0.23065	1.16OZ	OCEAN SPRAY, CRAISINS DRIED(SEE ATTACHED FLAVORS)	\$ 48.29	\$ 0.2415
119	Mandarin Orange) Meets 4.5 oz - 1/2 cup fruit	48 4.5 oz.	680					NO BID					
123	Fruit Mixed Canned in Light Syrup US Grade B or Better	6#10	155	#10 CN	56.91	9.49	6 / #10	\$ 49.29	\$ 8.2150	#10	DEL MONTE , MIXED FRUIT EXTRA LIGHT SYRUP	\$ 52.13	\$ 8.6883
124	Peaches Canned Diced in Light Syrup US Grade B or Better	6#10	55	#10 CN	55.27	9.21	6 / #10	\$ 50.89	\$ 8.4817	#10	DEL MONTE , DICED PEACHES EX LS	\$ 53.22	\$ 8.8700
125	Pears Canned Diced in Light Syrup USDA Grade B or Better	6#10	55	#10 CN	61.51	10.25	6 / #10	\$ 53.18	\$ 8.8633	#10	DEL MONTE , DICED PEARS ELS	\$ 49.33	\$ 8.2217
126	Pineapple Tidbits Canned in Pineapple Juice USDA Grade B or Better	6#10	290	#10 CN	44.42	7.40	6 / #10	\$ 29.67	\$ 4.9450	#10	JACKPOT, PINEAPPLE TIDBITS IN JUICE	\$ 29.40	\$ 4.9000
127	Corn Canned Whole Kernel Vacuum Pack US Grade B or Better	6-75OZ	230	#10 CN	40.60	6.77	6 / 75 OZ	\$ 29.89	\$ 4.9817	#10	SENECA, CORN WHOLE KERNEL LS	\$ 31.85	\$ 5.3083
128	Green Beans Canned Special Cut US Grade B or Better	6#10	120	#10 CN	41.72	6.95	6 / #10	\$ 35.41	\$ 5.9017	#10	SENECA, GREEN BEANS CUT LS	\$ 32.28	\$ 5.3800
129	Carrots, Canned US Grade B or Better	6#10	215	#10 CN	38.85	6.47	6 / #10	\$ 40.38	\$ 6.7300	#10	SENECA, CARROTS DICED LS	\$ 31.72	\$ 5.2867
130	Pepper & Onion Blend 6/4# Frozen	24#	115	4 LB	46.75	7.79	6 / 2.5 LB	\$ 37.67	\$ 6.2783				
131	Potatoes, Diced 1/2", Frozen 2/10#	20#	145					NO BID		5LB	SIMPLOT , POTATO 1/2" CUBE	\$ 35.26	\$ 1.7630
132	Potatoes, Frzn 3/8" Crinkle Cut 6/5# OVEN READY	30#	3470	5 LB	53.21 55.06	8.87 9.18	6 / 5LB	\$ 42.53	\$ 7.0883	5LB	MCCAIN FOODS INC, OVATIONS 3/8" CRINKLE CUT FRY	\$ 45.96	\$ 1.5320
133	Basic American, Dehydrated Potato Pearl 12/28 oz	21 #	130	28 OZ	75.06	6.25	6 / 5.31LB	\$ 64.66	\$ 10.7767				
CONDIMENT/DRESSINGS/MISC.													
134	BBQ Sauce Dipper Cup 1 oz	100	2545	250/1OZ	38.92	0.16	100 / 1 OZ	\$ 9.17	\$ 0.0917	1OZ	KRAFT HEINZ FOODS, BBQ SAUCE BULLSEYE	\$ 12.09	\$ 0.1209
135	Dressing Ranch DIPPER CUP 1oz LITE OR REDUCED FAT - FAT FREE	100	5320	1 OZ	21.65	0.22							
136	Jalapeños, sliced 6 #10 or 1 Gal	6#10	255	#10 CN	39.46	6.58	6 / #10	\$ 32.60	\$ 5.4333	#10	DEL SOL, SLICED JALAPENOS	\$ 29.07	\$ 4.8450
137	Ketchup Portion Control 9 gm. Low Sodium	1000	3660	9 GM	27.68	0.03	1000 / 9 GM	\$ 21.11	\$ 0.02111	9GM	KRAFT HEINZ FOODS CO, KETCHUP TOMATO PACKETS LS	\$ 24.14	\$ 0.0241
138	Mayonnaise Portion Control 12gm FAT FREE	200	1912	0.44 OZ	17.71	0.09	200/12 GM	\$ 16.05	\$ 0.08025	12GR	FOUR IN ONE, MAYO REDUCE FAT POUCH	\$ 15.67	\$ 0.0784
139	Mayonnaise - Heavy Duty 1 gal	4 1GAL	72	1 GL	50.11	12.53	4 / 1 GAL	\$ 55.08	\$ 13.77	1GL	GARDEN BANNER, MAYONNAISE PREMIUM	\$ 45.48	\$ 11.3700

IMPERIAL COUNTY SCHOOL FOOD SERVICE CO-OP
PRICE PROPOSAL SHEETS 2023 - 2024

Name of Vendor: Master List

SPEC No.	DESCRIPTION	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	Total Anticipated Co-Op Usage	Shamrock			Sysco			Gold Star			
				UNIT SIZE	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	PRODUCT NAME	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE
140	Mayonnaise - Heavy Duty 1 gal Best Foods brand	4 1GAL	79	1 GL	104.51	26.13	4 / 1 GAL	\$ 86.64	\$ 21.66	1GL	BEST FOODS, MAYONNAISE	\$ 99.49	\$ 24.8725
141	Syrup Portion Control PACKET 1.5 oz (42gm)	200	1700	1.5 OZ	33.68	0.17	200 / 1 OZ	\$ 27.16	\$ 0.13580				
142	Mustard Portion Control 5.5 gm	1000	1206				500/5.5 GRM	\$ 11.90	\$ 0.02380				
143	Juice, Lemon Packet 4 gm	500	198	200/4/GM	12.14	0.06	500 / 4 GM	\$ 15.48	\$ 0.03096				
144	Sauce, Hot, Packet, Tapatio 7 gm	500	841	7 GM	38.73	0.08	500 / 7 GR	\$ 35.34	\$ 0.07068	7GR	TAPATIO, HOT SAUCE PACKETS	\$ 38.31	\$ 0.0766
145	Sauce, Tabasco Packet 3 gm	200	323	3 GM	16.52	0.08	200/3 GRM	\$ 14.81	\$ 0.07405	3GM	TABASCO, TABACO SAUCE	\$ 15.88	\$ 0.0794
146	Low Sodium Tajin Sachets (Packets) .05 oz. (1.5 gm.)	1000	1280	1 GM	52.37	0.05	1000 / 1 GRAM	\$ 67.28		.035	TAJIN, SEASON LS TAJIN PACKETS	\$ 48.74	\$ 0.0487
147	Croutons, Cheese & Garlic (Must meet Whole Grain Rich Criteria) Zero Trans Fat, 4/2.5 LB	10 LBS.	694	2.5 LB	28.41	7.10		NO BID		2.5LB	SUGAR FOODS, CROUTONS CHS GARLIC BULK WG	\$ 27.07	\$ 6.9925
148	Taco Sauce Portion Control 9gm	500	110	9 GM	27.12	0.05	500 / 9 GM	\$ 14.82	\$ 0.0296	9GR	FOUR IN ONE, SAUCE TACO PACKETS	\$ 18.54	\$ 0.0371
149	Pickle chips dill 1/8 Inch Cut Uniform Slicing 1 Gallon	4 1GAL	82	1 GL	22.45	5.61	4/1 GAL	\$ 23.20	\$ 5.8000	1GAL	MRS KLEIN PICKLE, DILL PICKLE CHIPS 1/8 SMOOTH	\$ 23.85	\$ 5.9625
150	Bottled Water (Short Bottles Only) 8 oz	48	2680				48 / 8 OZ	\$ 7.15	\$ 0.1490				
151	Frank's Red Hot Original Sauce	4 / 1 GAL	90	1 GL	70.75	17.69	4 / 1 GAL	\$ 54.98	\$ 13.7450	1GAL	FRANKS RED HOT, SAUCE RED HOT CAYENNE PEPPER	\$ 64.11	\$ 16.0275
152	Marco's, Tomatillo Verde Jalapeño Salsa	4 / 2.5 LB	65	8/2.5/LB	69.79	8.72		NO BID					

PROCESSED COMMODITIES

153	Beef Patties Fambri (Fully Cooked) Min 2.5 oz CN Label Must Meet 2 oz MMA	90	2600	2.5 OZ	55.10	0.61	90 / 2.5OZ	\$ 55.90	\$ 0.62111				
156	69012 Approx. 3.88 oz CN Must Meet 2 oz MMA and 1oz equivalent grain	124 Servings	450	3.88 OZ	142.14	1.15	500/97 OZ	\$ 58.55	\$ 0.11710				
159	Tyson Chicken Nuggets Breaded Fully Cooked # 070364-0928 grain	149 Servings	2200	8 LB	85.16	21.29	149	\$ 60.58	\$ 0.40658	3.5OZ	TYSON, NUGGETS BRD CRISPY WG	\$ 91.58	\$ 0.6146
162	0928 3.36 oz Serving CN Must Meet 2 oz MMA and 1 oz equivalent grain	155 Servings	950	8 LB	86.78	21.70	155	\$ 66.93	\$ 0.43181	3.36OZ	TYSON, WG POPCORN CHICKEN	\$ 93.40	\$ 0.6026
165	165 Tyson Chicken Patties, Breaded Fully Cooked # 070304-0928 3.54 oz Serving CN Must Meet 2 oz MMA and 1 oz equivalent grain	148 Servings	1605	8.2 LB	86.16	21.54	148	\$ 61.63	\$ 0.41642	3.0OZ	TYSON, BRD CRISPY PATTIES WG	\$ 92.71	\$ 0.6264
168	070314-0928 3.53 oz. Serving CN Must Meet 2 oz MMA and 1 oz equivalent grain	148 Servings	2165	7.5 LB	84.07	21.02	148	\$ 61.66	\$ 0.41662	3OZ	TYSON, BRD SPICY CHIX PATTIES WG	\$ 90.36	\$ 0.6105
171	#026436-0928 Must Meet 2.5 oz MMA	30 lb.	975	30 LB	92.37	92.37	30 LB	\$ 59.80	\$ 1.99333	0-128PC	TYSON, DK MSQTE GLZ CHX DRMSTKS	\$ 99.68	\$ 3.3227
172	#666000-0928 Meets 2-3.25 MMA and .75-1 oz. equivalent grain	82 Pieces	685	7.5 LB	95.46	23.87	82 PIECES	\$ 65.27	\$ 0.79598	0	TYSON, WG BRD PROPORTION BONE-IN CHIX	\$ 103.15	\$ 1.2579
173	173 Chicken Tender Breaded Fully Cooked #070334-0928 Approx. 3.39 oz CN Must Meet 2 oz MMA and 1oz equivalent grain	150 Servings	860	8 LB	77.06	19.27	150	\$ 57.24	\$ 0.38160	7.965LB	TYSON, WG CN CRISPY TENDERS	\$ 82.48	\$ 0.5499
176	1000004108 6/4# OVEN READY	24 lb.	3135	4 LB	44.38	7.40	24 LB	\$ 35.71	\$ 1.48792	4LB	MCCAIN FOODS INC, FFRY SPIRAL SEASONED RS	\$ 45.77	\$ 1.9071
179	179 Potatoes, Frzn Ore-Ida Reduced Sodium Tater Tots # 1000002789 6/5# OVEN READY	30 lb.	2760	5 LB	50.14	8.36	30 LB	\$ 40.89	\$ 1.36300	5LB	MCCAIN FOODS INC, TATER TOTS REDUCED SODIUM	\$ 52.39	\$ 1.7463
182	182 Three Cheese Calzone, WG, 5.5oz 2MMA 2GB	80	1715	5.5 OZ	86.83	1.09	60 / 4.9 OZ	\$ 52.84	\$ 0.88067	5.5OZ	BUENA VISTA, WG RF 3 CHEESE CALZONE IW	\$ 90.09	\$ 1.1261
183	183 CN Label Must Meet 2 oz MMA and oz equivalent grain	24	305				96 / 4.48OZ	\$ 43.37	\$ 0.45177				
184	184 Cheese Quesadilla, WG 2MMA 2GB	100 4.11oz	660				1 / 96CNT	\$ 59.74	\$ 0.62229				

IMPERIAL COUNTY SCHOOL FOOD SERVICE CO-OP
PRICE PROPOSAL SHEETS 2023 - 2024

Name of Vendor: Master List

SPEC No.	DESCRIPTION	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	Total Anticipated Co-Op Usage	Shamrock			Sysco			Gold Star			
				UNIT	CASE	UNIT	PACK SIZE	CASE	UNIT	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	PRODUCT NAME	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE
				SIZE	PRICE	PRICE	UNITS/CASE	PRICE	PRICE				
185	BIG DADDY'S Primo 16" WG Par-Baked Crust Four Cheese Pizza 2MMA 2GB	72	3775	3 PK	72.16	24.05	72	\$ 54.05	\$ 0.75069	5.13OZ	BIG DADDY'S, PRIMO 16" WG PAR-BKD 4 CHS PZA	\$ 72.39	\$ 1.0054
PROTEIN-M/MA-COMBINATION FOOD													
186	Pork OR Beef Rib Shaped Patty (Fully Cooked) CN Label Must Meet 2 oz MMA	52	1100	100/2.5/OZ	66.49	0.66		NO BID					
187	Beef Patties Fambri (Fully Cooked) Min 2.5 oz CN Label Must Meet 2 oz MMA	90	555	2.5 OZ	55.10	0.61	90 / 2.5OZ	\$ 55.90	\$ 0.62111				
188	Burrito Bean & Cheese IW (Must meet WG rich criteria) 7 oz CN Label Must Meet 2 oz MMA and oz. equivalent grain	96	1325	96/5.2/OZ	76.89	0.80		NO BID					
189	PUPUSAS Meets 2 MMA - 2 oz. equivalent grain #2133-928	40	705	5 PK	55.33	6.92	40	\$ 47.28	\$ 1.18200	5.5OZ	DEL REAL, PUPUSA BEAN CHEESE GF	\$ 50.30	\$ 1.2575
190	Must Meet 2 oz MMA	10 lb.	540				30 LB	\$ 66.08	\$ 2.20267	10LB	TYSON, GLAZED BBQ JUMBO SLUGGER	\$ 31.44	\$ 31.4400
191	Corndog, Turkey 4 oz (Must meet WG rich criteria) CN Label Must Meet 2 oz MMA and oz equivalent grain	48	3680	4 OZ	34.11	0.71							
193	Al Pastor, Marinated Pork 4/5# bags	20 lb.	180	5 LB	107.94	26.98		NO BID		20LB	DEL REAL, AL PASTOR GF	\$ 98.83	
194	Meatsauce, Beef Spaghetti Sauce 6/5 lb bags, Suace provides 2 mma & 1/2 Cup red/orange vegetable	30#	180	5 LB	95.11	15.85		NO BID					
195	Fully Cooked Glazed Chicken Wings, Tyson or Equivalent 4/7.5 lb bags	30#	375				30 LB	\$ 84.13	\$ 2.80433	7.5LB	TYSON, CHICKEN WINGS OVEN ROASTED	\$ 127.68	
196	Turkey Bacon, Fully Cooked Crispy Jennie-O or Equivalent 12/50 PK	7.5 lbs	50	50 PK	100.98	8.42		no bid					
197	Franks 8/1# Turkey Aprox 6" CN Must Meet 2 oz MMA	10#	485	5 LB	28.81	14.40	10	\$ 21.61	\$ 0.27013				
198	Fish Nuggets Shaped (Must meet WG rich criteria) CN Label	10#	25	10 LB	39.23	39.23		NO BID		10LB	TRIDENT SEAFOODS, POLLOCK NUGGETS WG	\$ 39.97	
199	Cheese Filled Bread Stick (Must meet WG rich criteria) CN Label Must Meet 2 oz MMA	108	560	1 BREADSTICK	66.45	0.33	108	\$ 52.76	\$ 0.48852				
200	criteria) CN Label	24	1225	6 OZ	56.48	1.18	48 / 4.46OZ	\$ 42.83	\$ 0.89229				
201	Taquito, Chicken Shredded (Meets WG rich Criteria) CN Label Must Meet 2 oz MMA and 2 oz Grain	100 Ct.	955	1 TAQUITO	37.29	0.37	100/2.2 OZ	\$ 58.52	\$ 0.58520	2.2OZ	MICHAEL B'S BESTWAY, TAQUITOS CHICKEN BULK WG	\$ 61.40	
202	criteria) Meets 2 oz. eq. grain & 2 oz MMA	12	310	4 PK	62.37	5.20	48	\$ 54.37	\$ 1.13271	5OZ	DEL REAL, TAMALES CHS GREEN CHILI GF WG	\$ 56.64	
203	criteria) Meets 2 oz. eq. grain & 2 oz MMA	12	3610	4 PK	59.72	4.98	48	\$ 52.40	\$ 1.09167	5OZ	DEL REAL, TAMALES CHIC RED SAUCE GF WG	\$ 54.55	
204	criteria) CN Must Meet 2 oz MMA and 1.5oz equivalent grain	72	1915	4.19 OZ	70.33	0.98		NO BID		3.69OZ	INTEGRATED, GRILL CHEESE WG RS RFIW	\$ 66.15	
205	Egg Patties Scrambled Fully Cooked 1 oz CN Label	369	195	1.5 OZ	59.10	0.35		NO BID		1.25OZ	SUNNY FRESH, PATTY EGG GRILLED CAGE FREE	\$ 120.78	
206	Sausage Patties Fully Cooked & Browned 1 oz - 1.5 oz	10#	375	10 LB	28.04	28.04	107 / 1.5 OZ	\$ 23.66	\$ 0.22112	0	JIMMY DEAN, PATTY TURKEY SAUSAGE	\$ 29.09	
207	Ham, Diced 3/8" Frozen Fully Cooked Hormel or Equivalent	10#	95	10 LB	38.26	38.26		NO BID		5LB	FARMLAND, 1/4 X 1/4 HAM DICED	\$ 38.63	
208	Pizza Topping, Sausage Pork Crumbles, Cooked 2/5#	10#	40	5 LB	26.20	13.10		NO BID		5LB	TYSON, FC BREAKFAST PORK CRUMBLES	\$ 28.64	
209	Jennie O Turkey, Combo Pack Extra Lean	12	230	1 LB	46.83	3.90	12 / 1 LB	\$ 45.71	\$ 3.8092	1LB	SLC	\$ 48.51	
210	Ranchero Beef Steak & Cheese Tornado Serving Size: 1 Tornado, 2.79oz (1GB, 0.5MMA)	144	315	3 OZ	20.84	0.87		NO BID					
211	Pre-Cooked Scrambled Eggs, Sunny Fresh	4 / 5 LB	150	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		NO BID		5LB	SUNNY FRESH, EGGS SCRAMBLED PRE CKD CAGE FREE	\$ 99.18	
	Jennie O Turkey, All Natural Smokehouse Turkey Breast Sticks										JENNIE O, TURKEY STICK		

IMPERIAL COUNTY SCHOOL FOOD SERVICE CO-OP
PRICE PROPOSAL SHEETS 2023 - 2024

Name of Vendor: Master List

SPEC No.	DESCRIPTION	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	Total Anticipated Co-Op Usage	Shamrock			Sysco			Gold Star			
				UNIT SIZE	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PRODUCT NAME	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	
212	Meets 1 oz MMA	400/1.2oz	210	1.2 OZ	258.63	0.65	400 / 1.2 OZ	\$ 233.97	\$ 0.58493	1.2OZ	SMOKEHOUSE	\$ 286.49	
213	Jennie O Turkey, All Natural Smoked Turkey Breast 1.75" Sliced 5 slices = 1 MMA	6 / 2 LB	215	2 LB	67.83	11.31	6 / 2 LB	\$ 65.40	\$ 10.90	2LB	JENNIE O, ALL NATURAL SMOKED TRKY BREAST	\$ 65.77	
214	Hard Cooked Peeled Eggs, Sunny Fresh 1 Medium Egg = 1 oz equivalent MMA	8 / 18 count	204	1.25 LB	51.28	4.27	144	\$ 64.60	\$ 0.44861	6CT	SUNNY FRESH, EGG HARD COOKED PEELED CF	\$ 82.49	
215	Pepperoni, Sliced 16 per oz 2/12.5 lbs	25 lbs	105	12.5 LB	98.33	49.16		NO BID					
216	Bakery or Equivalent 90/2.55 OZ	14.3 LBS	190	2.55 OZ	46.86	0.52				2.55OZ	DAVES, CORNMEAL SUPER STAR WG	\$ 45.09	\$ 0.5010

BREAD FROZEN/FRESH

217	Bread Sandwich Whole-Wheat 1.5# (Must meet WG rich criteria) Whole Wheat Grain Content- Dark or White	LOAF	6620	24 OZ	23.41	3.90		NO BID		1LF	PAPAPITA BAKERY, SANDWICH BREAD 100% WW	\$ 2.89	\$ 2.89
218	Hot dog Bun Sliced Dark or White (Must meet WG rich criteria) Whole Wheat Grain Content	DOZ	2070	12 PK	33.17	2.76		NO BID		2OZ	FRESH BREAD, 5" HOTDOG BUN 51% WG	\$ 3.46	\$ 0.2883
219	Whole Wheat Grain Content Dark or White (criteria)	DOZ	16090	12 PK	30.18	3.02		NO BID		2.07OZ	FRESH BREAD, 4" 51% HAMBURGER BUNS WWW	\$ 3.20	\$ 0.2687
220	Whole Wheat Grain Content	6 EA	8000	6 PK	26.89	2.25		NO BID					
221	Sub Roll 4" to 5" Sliced Dark or White (Must meet WG rich criteria) Whole Wheat Grain Content	6 EA	750	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		NO BID					
222	Whole Wheat Grain Content (criteria) Frozen	DOZ	4700	2.25 OZ	47.57	0.19		NO BID		1.85OZ	FRESH BREAD, 3" 51% DINNER ROLLS WWW	\$ 3.10	\$ 0.2583
223	Meets 1 oz. eq. grain (criteria) Frozen	16 12 PK	2590	1 OZ	36.59	0.23		NO BID					
224	Meets 2 oz. eq. grain (criteria) Frozen	10 12 PK	1400	12 PK	30.18	3.02		NO BID					
225	Frozen Meets 2 oz. eq. grain	12 12 PK	1500	12 PK	33.17	2.76		NO BID		144CT	GOLD STAR FOODS, 5" BUN HOTDOG 51% WG	\$ 29.56	\$ 0.2053
226	Bun, Steak WG Hinged (Must meet WG rich criteria) Frozen Meets 2 oz. eq. grain	12 6 PK	1465	6 PK	26.99	2.25		NO BID					
227	Tortilla, Flour 10" (Must meet WG rich criteria) Frozen Meets a minimum 1.5 oz. eq. grain.	4 24 PK	1559	24 PK	18.83	4.71		NO BID					
228	8 Inch Tortilla Flour (Must meet WG rich criteria) Whole Wheat Grain Content	DOZ	986	24 PK	22.08	3.68		NO BID					
229	Chips Corn Tortilla Bulk (Must meet WG rich criteria) 12 # Case	6/2#	265					NO BID		6/2LB	LA VENCEDORA, TORTILLA CHIPS BULK	\$ 20.32	\$ 3.3867
230	Must meet 1.25 Whole Grain 1255	12						NO BID					
231	Rich's 16" Sheeted Pizza Dough (Must meet WG rich criteria) Meets 2 oz. Equivalent Whole Wheat Grain Content for 8 slice	48 PK 32 16.5 oz	1890 75	60 PK 18/17OZ	36.12 42.52	3.01 2.36		NO BID					

PAPER AND DISPOSABLES

232	Bags Clear Saddle	2000	1430	1 BAG	25.07	0.01	2000	\$ 13.99	\$ 0.00700			NO BID	
233	Cups 4 oz. Plastic	2500	550	100 PK	57.01	2.28	3000	\$ 52.91	\$ 0.01764			NO BID	
234	Lid 4 oz. Plastic Clear	2500	550	100 PK	44.42	1.78	2400	\$ 26.46	\$ 0.01103			NO BID	
235	Bowls 8 oz. Styro B-8	1000	620	50 PK	58.78	2.94	1000 / 8OZ	\$ 57.77	\$ 0.05777			NO BID	
236	Lid 8 oz. Vented for 8 oz Styro Bowl FL-8V	1000	620	100 PK	37.37	3.74	1000	\$ 36.66	\$ 0.03666			NO BID	
237	Cup 5.5 oz Plastic	2500	545	100 PK	66.93	2.68	2000	\$ 44.10	\$ 0.02205			NO BID	

IMPERIAL COUNTY SCHOOL FOOD SERVICE CO-OP
PRICE PROPOSAL SHEETS 2023 - 2024

Name of Vendor: Master List

SPEC No.	DESCRIPTION	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	Total Anticipated Co-Op Usage	Shamrock			Sysco			Gold Star				
				UNIT SIZE	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	PRODUCT NAME	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	
238	Lid 5.5 oz Plastic Clear	2500	540	100 PK	44.42	1.78	25000	\$ 31.75	\$ 0.01270				NO BID	
239	Oblong, Cont. Foil 8x6x2		725				400	\$ 55.44	\$ 0.13860				NO BID	
240	Lid, Dome 8x6x2 Oblong		725				800	\$ 53.82	\$ 0.06728				NO BID	
241	Oblong w/ lid, Cont. Foil 8x6x2, 3 Compartment		1135	1 CONTAINER	108.30	0.53	200	\$ 62.20	\$ 0.31100				NO BID	
242	Food Tray 6oz	1000	215	250 PK	31.57	7.89		NO BID					NO BID	
243	Food Tray #50	1000	199	250 PK	32.50	8.13		NO BID		1000	SUPERIOR QUALITY PRODUCTS, TRAY #50 FOOD	\$ 28.52	\$ 0.0285	
244	Food Tray #100	1000	217	250 PK	38.93	9.73		NO BID		1000	SUPERIOR QUALITY PRODUCTS, #100 FOOD TRY	\$ 32.40	\$ 0.0324	
245	Food Tray #200	1000	336	250 PK	46.74	11.68		NO BID					NO BID	
246	Food Tray # 500	500	2286	250 PK	45.33	22.66	500	\$ 28.63	\$ 0.05726	500	SUPERIOR QUALITY PRODUCTS, TRAY #500 FOOD	\$ 35.16	\$ 0.07	
247	Squat Container 4oz. Foam	1000	477	50 PK	33.45	1.67	1000	\$ 36.43	\$ 0.36430				NO BID	
248	Squat Container Lid 4oz.	1000	467	100 PK	21.73	2.17	1000	\$ 21.32	\$ 0.21320				NO BID	
249	Food Tray 5 Compartment	500	6350	125 PK	23.57	5.89	500	\$ 26.46	\$ 0.05292					
250	Squat Container 12oz. Foam	1000	245	25 PK	36.15	1.81	500	\$ 34.88	\$ 0.06976				NO BID	
251	Squat Container Lid 12oz.	1000	225	100 PK	37.37	3.74	1000	\$ 36.66	\$ 0.36660				NO BID	
252	Food Tray Hinged 3 comp.8x8x2	200	225	100 PK	28.80	14.40	150	\$ 16.93	\$ 0.11287				NO BID	
253	Food Tray Hinged Clamshell Clear Plastic Aprox 6"X6"	250	565	125 PK	75.89	18.97	500	\$ 35.98	\$ 0.07196				NO BID	
254	Food Tray Hinged Clamshell Clear Plastic Aprox 5x5x3 -375 ct	375	228	500 PK	111.98	0.22	375	\$ 49.33	\$ 0.13155				NO BID	
255	Gloves Disposable Vinyl Powder Free Medium Sized	1000	843	100 PK	32.44	3.24	1000	\$ 29.41	\$ 0.02941	MEDIUM	GOLDMAX INDUSTRIES, MEDIUM P/F VINYL GLOVES	\$ 31.59	\$ 0.0316	
256	Gloves Disposable Vinyl Powder Free Large Sized	1000	853	100 PK	32.51	3.25	1000	\$ 29.55	\$ 0.02955	LARGE	GOLDMAX INDUSTRIES, LARGE P/F VINYL GLOVES	\$ 31.59	\$ 0.0316	
257	Gloves Disposable Vinyl Powder Free Extra large Sized	1000	665	100 PK	32.61	3.26	1000	\$ 29.70	\$ 0.02970	EX LARG	GOLDMAX INDUSTRIES, X-LARGE P/F VINYL GLOVES	\$ 31.59	\$ 0.0316	
258	Sporkette Kit Regular PSKF1800 (Flat end milk straw kit)	1000	10450	1 KIT	32.70	0.03	1000	\$ 20.55	\$ 0.02055	1000	PACTIV, WHITE SPORK NAPKIN MILK STRAW	\$ 51.99	\$ 0.0520	
259	Cups 8 oz. Squat Foam	1000	798	25 PK	32.51	0.81	1000	\$ 57.67	\$ 0.05767				NO BID	
260	Lids 8 oz Squat	1000	638	100 PK	21.81	2.18	1000	\$ 36.66	\$ 0.03666				NO BID	
261	Food Tray #300	4	1060	250 PK	34.91	17.46	500	\$ 22.36	\$ 0.04472	500	SUPERIOR QUALITY PRODUCTS, TRAY #300 FOOD	\$ 27.59	\$ 0.0552	
262	Wrap Foil 10.5X13 Teal Stripe	5	372	500 PK	133.63	26.73	2500	\$ 152.83	\$ 0.06113				NO BID	
263	Wiper Wypall X-50 Foodservice	200	941	1 WIPE	10.34	0.05		NO BID					NO BID	
264	Foil Roll Heavy 18X1M Kari-Out	1	425	1 ROLL	90.16	90.16	1	\$ 97.07	\$ 97.07	1	PACTIV, 18"X1000' HEAVY DUTY FOIL	\$ 84.22	\$ 84.22	
265	Foil Roll Standard 18X1M Kari-Out	1	370	1 ROLL	98.31	98.31	1	\$ 64.01	\$ 64.01	1	PACTIV, 18"X1000' STANDARD FOIL	\$ 71.70	\$ 71.70	

IMPERIAL COUNTY SCHOOL FOOD SERVICE CO-OP
PRICE PROPOSAL SHEETS 2023 - 2024

Name of Vendor: Master List

SPEC No.	DESCRIPTION	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	Total Anticipated Co-Op Usage	Shamrock			Sysco			Gold Star										
				UNIT SIZE	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	PRODUCT NAME	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE							
266	Bowl Styro 22 oz. Rice White Pactiv#TH10020	504 CS	40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid														
267	PAKFCDL06S	504 CS	40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid														
268	Liner Sheet Pan 16X24 Quilon P	1000 CS	820	1 SHEET	61.55	0.06	1000	\$ 57.74	\$ 0.05774											
269	FoodHandler Pan Pals High-Heat Liner 34"X18" Item# PL3418	50 CS	160	1 SHEET	38.31	0.77														
270	Liner 45 GL HD 40S48 18MIC NAT	250 CS	290	10 PK	47.15	1.89	250	\$ 32.64	\$ 0.13056											
271	Pactiv # 4071009 Insert for 4 oz cup PP 10/75ct	750 CS	55	1 CUP	84.17 77.40	0.11 0.15	750	\$ 56.91	\$ 0.07588											
272	Pactiv # 7473477 Lid Plas Clr 12/85ct	1020 CS	52				1020	\$ 59.66	\$ 0.05849											
273	Pactiv #7762026 Cup Plas Clr Pet 12-14 oz 10/70ct	700 CS	62				420	\$ 36.22	\$ 0.08624											
274	Pactiv #7474812 Cup Plas Clr Pet 16 oz 10/70ct	700 CS	68				700	\$ 101.92	\$ 0.14560											
275	Detergent Pot & Pan Pink Suds Accurate	5 GAL	216				4/1 GAL	\$ 28.23	\$ 7.05750											
276	Accu-Quat Accurate Sanitizer	4 / 1 GAL	210				4 / 1 GAL	\$ 206.87	\$ 51.71750											
277	Special Green Glisten Cleaner	4 / 1 GAL	140					NO BID												
278	Easy Clean Accurate Anti Slip Floor Cleaner	4 / 1 GAL	125				1/2.5 GAL	\$ 175.94	\$ 175.94											

Legend
Items that will be awarded together highlighted in gray.

Name of Vendor: Master List

SPEC No.	DESCRIPTION	Flower Foods			
		PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	PRODUCT NAME	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE

Fiesta				
PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	UNIT SIZE	PRODUCT NAME	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE

BAKED CHIPS - SINGLE SERVE (NO TRANS FATS ANI

54	Hot and Spicy Fries - Baked (Must meet WG rich criteria) .75 oz Bag Meets 1 oz. equivalent grain criteria)				
55	1 oz Bag Meets 1 oz equivalent grain criteria)				
56	1 oz Bag Meets 1 oz equivalent grain rich criteria)				
57	1 oz Bag Meets 1 oz equivalent grain meet WG rich criteria)				
58	1 oz Bag Meets 1 oz equivalent grain WG rich Criteria)				
59	1 oz Bag Meets 1 oz equivalent grain				
60	Chips Corn Tortilla IW (Must meet WG rich criteria) Min 2.0 oz Round Meet 2 oz equivalent grain				
61	Walking Taco Fito Corn Chips 1.5 oz bag meets 2 oz grain equivalent				
62	TOSTITOS BAKED Meets 1.25 oz. equivalent grain				
63	Hot Cheetos Baked (Must meet WG rich criteria) 1 oz Bag Meets 1 oz equivalent grain				
64	Baked BBQ Potato Chips, Lays (Must meet WG rich criteria) 1 oz Bag Meets 1 oz equivalent grain				
65	Baked Original Potato Chips, Lays (Must meet WG rich criteria) 1 oz Bag Meets 1 oz equivalent grain				
66	Baked Sour Cream Onion Potato Chips, Lays (Must meet WG rich criteria) 1 oz Bag Meets 1 oz equivalent grain				

150 ct	La Vencedora 150ct PP Round 2.0 oz. Whole Grain Chips - ELR2-150		38.50	38.50

CRACKERS/COOKIES (NO TRANS FATS AND MUST M

67	Crackers, Animal (Must meet WG rich criteria) 1 oz to 1.5 oz Meet 1 oz equivalent grain				
68	Crackers, Honey Graham 3 Pack IW (Must meet WG rich criteria) Variety Flavors Must Meet 1 oz equivalent grain criteria)				
69	1 oz to 1.5 oz Must Meet 1 oz equivalent grain				
70	Graham Cookies Kelloggs Bug Bites (Must meet WG rich criteria) 1 oz to 1.5 oz Must Meet 1 oz equivalent grain				
71	CHEWY OATMEAL BITES BACK PACKERS - VARIETY Meets 1 oz. equivalent grain criteria)				
73	.75 oz. Must Meet 1 oz equivalent grain criteria)				
74	Meets 1 oz. eq. grain rich criteria)				
75	Meets 1 oz. eq. grain				
76	Cheez It Cracker (Must meet WG rich criteria) 0.75oz Meets 1 oz. eq. grain				
77	Zesta Saltine, Mini Crackers, (Must meet WG rich criteria) Meets .5 oz. eq. grain				
78	Kellogg's, Chat Snack, Vanilla Crunch Meets 1 oz. eq. grain				

BREAKFAST BREADS & BREAD ALTERNATES FROZE

79	Biscuits, Fully Baked Frozen 2.25oz (Must meet WG rich criteria) Whole Grain Content				
----	---	--	--	--	--

--	--	--	--	--

Name of Vendor: Master List

		Flower Foods			
SPEC No.	DESCRIPTION	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	PRODUCT NAME	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE
80	Concha (Must meet WG rich criteria)				
81	Churro Raspberry Filled (Must meet WG rich criteria) Whole Grain Content Pre Cooked 6"				
82	Dough, Cinn Swirl Roll WG Meets - 2 oz. equivalent grain				
83	ICEING, VANILLA HEAT N ICE RICHES - FRZN DESSERT TOPPING				
84	French Toast Sticks Fully Cooked (Must meet WG rich criteria) Whole Grain Content				
85	Pancakes Frozen Fully Cooked BULK (Must meet WG rich criteria) Whole Grain Content Aprox 1.3oz/4-1/2 "				
86	Brand Whole Grain Content 4 Count per Pkg				
87	Soft Filled Pastry, Cocoa Puffs (Must meet WG rich criteria) Whole Grain Content 2 oz equivalent Grains				
88	criteria) Whole Grain Content 2 oz equivalent Grains				
89	Waffle Stix Fully Cooked Bulk (Must meet WG rich criteria) Whole Grain Content Aprox 1 oz equivalent grain				
90	rich criteria) Whole Grain Content 1 oz equivalent grain				
92	Muffins All flavors, IW 1.8 oz. (Must meet WG rich criteria) Snack Requirements				
95	Muffins All flavors, IW 3 oz. (Must meet WG rich criteria) Whole Grain Content (2 oz. eq. grain)				
96	WG rich criteria) Meets 2 oz. eq. grain				
97	WG rich criteria) Meets 2 oz. eq. grain				
98	Mini Breakfast Bun Bites (Must meet WG rich criteria) Meets 2 oz. eq. grain				
99	Mini Cinnis (Must meet WG rich criteria) Meets 2 oz. eq. grain				
100	criteria) Meets 2 oz. eq. grain				
101	WG rich criteria) Meets 1 oz. eq. grain				
102	WG rich criteria) Meets 1.25 oz. eq. grain				
103	rich criteria) Meets 1.25 oz. eq. grain				
104	WG rich criteria) Meets 2.25 oz. eq. grain				
105	WG rich criteria) Meets 2.5 oz. eq. grain				
106	rich criteria) Meets 2.25 oz. eq. grain				

Fiesta				
PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	UNIT SIZE	PRODUCT NAME	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE

FRUIT/VEGETABLE

107	Juice Apple Frozen 4 oz. US Grade A Pasteurized				
108	Juice Grape Frozen 4 oz. US Grade A Pasteurized				
109	Juice Orange Frozen 4 oz. US Grade A Pasteurized				

Name of Vendor: Master List

SPEC No.	DESCRIPTION	Flower Foods				Fiesta				
		PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	PRODUCT NAME	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	UNIT SIZE	PRODUCT NAME	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE
266	Bowl Styro 22 oz. Rice White Pactiv#TH10020									
267	PAK#CDL06S									
268	Liner Sheet Pan 16X24 Quilon P									
269	FoodHandler Pan Pals High-Heat Liner 34"X18" Item# PL3418									
270	Liner 45 GL HD 40S48 18MIC NAT									
271	Pactiv # 4071009 Insert for 4 oz cup PP 10/75ct									
272	Pactiv # 7473477 Lid Plas Clr 12/85ct									
273	Pactiv #7762026 Cup Plas Clr Pet 12-14 oz 10/70ct									
274	Pactiv #7474812 Cup Plas Clr Pet 16 oz 10/70ct									
275	Detergent Pot & Pan Pink Suds Accurate									
276	Accu-Quat Accurate Sanitizer									
277	Special Green Glisten Cleaner									
278	Easy Clean Accurate Anti Slip Floor Cleaner									

Legend
 Items that will be awarded together highlighted in gray.

Name of Vendor: Master List

SPEC No.	DESCRIPTION	Padre USA					Brady IFS				Fulton			
		PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	UNIT SIZE	PRODUCT NAME	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	UNIT SIZE	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	UNIT SIZE	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE
212	Meets 1 oz MMA													
213	Jennie O Turkey, All Natural Smoked Turkey Breast 1.75" Sliced 5 slices = 1 MMA													
214	Hard Cooked Peeled Eggs, Sunny Fresh 1 Medium Egg = 1 oz equivalent MMA													
215	Pepperoni, Sliced 16 per oz 2/12.5 lbs Bakery or Equivalent													
216	90/2.55 OZ													

BREAD FROZEN/FRESH

217	Bread Sandwich Whole-Wheat 1.5# (Must meet WG rich criteria) Whole Wheat Grain Content- Dark or White													
218	Hot dog Bun Sliced Dark or White (Must meet WG rich criteria) Whole Wheat Grain Content criteria)													
219	Whole Wheat Grain Content Dark or White criteria)													
220	Whole Wheat Grain Content													
221	Sub Roll 4" to 5" Sliced Dark or White (Must meet WG rich criteria) Whole Wheat Grain Content criteria													
222	Whole Wheat Grain Content criteria) Frozen													
223	Meets 1 oz. eq. grain criteria) Frozen													
224	Meets 2 oz. eq. grain Frozen													
225	Meets 2 oz. eq. grain Bun, Steak WG Hinged (Must meet WG rich criteria) Frozen													
226	Meets 2 oz. eq. grain													
227	Tortilla, Flour 10" (Must meet WG rich criteria) Frozen Meets a minimum 1.5 oz. eq. grain.													
228	8 Inch Tortilla Flour (Must meet WG rich criteria) Whole Wheat Grain Content													
229	Chips Corn Tortilla Bulk (Must meet WG rich criteria) 12 # Case													
230	1255 Must meet 1.25 Whole Grain													
231	Rich's 16" Sheeted Pizza Dough (Must meet WG rich criteria) Meets 2 oz. Equivalent Whole Wheat Grain Content for 8 slice													

PAPER AND DISPOSABLES

232	Bags Clear Saddle	2000	6.50" x 7" x 1.5" .50 MIL 2000/cs	\$ 8.30	0.004	2000	\$ 7.73	2000	\$ 15.50
233	Cups 4 oz. Plastic	2500	4 OZ PORTION CUP CLEAR 2,500 CASE	\$ 49.90	0.020	2500	\$ 28.23	2500	\$ 45.95
234	Lid 4 oz. Plastic Clear	2500	4 OZ PORTION CUP LID CLEAR 2,500 CASE	\$ 35.70	0.014	2500	\$ 15.65	2500	\$ 42.95
235	Bowls 8 oz. Styro B-8	1000	8oz FOAM SQUAT VT8AXN	\$ 31.10	0.031	1000	\$ 64.90	1000	\$ 61.70
236	Lid 8 oz. Vented for 8 oz Styro Bowl FL-8V	1000	FOAM LID 8OZ TVT8XN	\$ 20.99	0.021	1000	\$ 41.26	1000	\$ 38.95
237	Cup 5.5 oz Plastic	2500	5.5 oz Portion Cup 2500 CASE	\$ 57.46	0.023	2500	\$ 30.81	2500	\$ 55.75

Name of Vendor: Master List

Name of Vendor: Master List		Padre USA						Brady IFS				Fulton			
SPEC No.	DESCRIPTION	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	UNIT SIZE	PRODUCT NAME	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	UNIT SIZE	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	PACK SIZE UNITS/CASE	UNIT SIZE	CASE PRICE	UNIT PRICE	
238	Lid 5.6 oz Plastic Clear	2500	4 OZ PORTION CUP LID CLEAR 2,500 CASE	\$ 35.70	0.014		2500		\$ 15.65		2500		\$ 42.85		
239	Oblong, Cont. Foil 8x6x2	500	8" Round Aluminum Foil Containers - 500 ct	\$ 60.18	0.120		500		\$ 47.27		500		\$ 59.56		
240	Lid, Dome 8x6x2 Oblong	500	8" OPS Dome Lids for Foil Containers - 500 ct	\$ 30.24	0.060		500		\$ 38.92		500		\$ 43.94		
241	Oblong w/ lid, Cont. Foil 8x6x2, 3 Compartment	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				\$ 76.45		NO BID		\$ 42.41		
242	Food Tray 6oz	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				\$ 17.77		NO BID		\$ 15.95		
243	Food Tray #50	1000	0.5 lb Food Tray - Shepherd's Check (Red) - 1,000 ct	\$ 23.90	0.024		1000		\$ 20.15		1000		\$ 18.20		
244	Food Tray #100	1000	1.0 lb Food Tray - Shepherd's Check (Red) - 1,000 ct	\$ 28.15	0.028		1000		\$ 23.26		1000		\$ 21.45		
245	Food Tray #200	1000	2.0 lb Food Tray - Shepherd's Check (Red) - 1,000 ct	\$ 30.54	0.031		1000		\$ 27.58		1000		\$ 23.55		
246	Food Tray # 500	500	5.0 lb Food Tray - Shepherd's Check (Red) - 500 ct	\$ 33.58	0.067		500		\$ 30.76		500		\$ 26.25		
247	Squat Container 4oz. Foam	1000	VT4CHXN FOAM SQUAT 4 OZ	\$ 24.02	0.024		1000		\$ 36.93		1000		\$ 30.95		
248	Squat Container Lid 4oz.	1000	FOAM CUP LID 4CH(SQUAT 4 oz) TVT4CH6XN	\$ 19.05	0.019		1000		\$ 23.99		1000		\$ 22.50		
249	Food Tray 5 Compartment	500	SCHOOL TRAY 5 COMP SLT5RU	\$ 28.98	0.058		500		\$ 25.58		500		\$ 27.95		
250	Squat Container 12oz. Foam	1000	FOAM SQUAT 12 OZ VT12AXN	\$ 34.15	0.034		1000		\$ 39.91		1000		\$ 75.15		
251	Squat Container Lid 12oz.	1000	TVT4A12XN FOAM CUO LID 4A(SQUAT 6 oz)/12	\$ 22.75	0.023		1000		\$ 41.26		1000		\$ 38.95		
252	Food Tray Hinged 3 comp.8x8x2	500	PT9D TRAY 3 COMPARTMENT FOAM	\$ 24.20	0.048		500		\$ 23.05		500		\$ 21.95		
253	Food Tray Hinged Clamshell Clear Plastic Aprox 6"x6"	500	6" x 6" PET Hinged Container, 1 compartment	\$ 56.25	0.113		500		\$ 49.53		500		\$ 66.25		
254	Food Tray Hinged Clamshell Clear Plastic Aprox 5x5x3 -375 ct	250	PS CLEAR HINGED CONTAINER 5.7x5.23 RB180XN	\$ 25.85	0.103		250		\$ 53.72		250		\$ 66.25		
255	Gloves Disposable Vinyl Powder Free Medium Sized	1000	CLEAR VINYL POWDER FREE GLOVES MEDIUM 1000CS	\$ 19.40	#DIV/0!		1000		\$ 18.99		1000		\$ 24.95		
256	Gloves Disposable Vinyl Powder Free Large Sized	1000	CLEAR VINYL POWDER FREE GLOVES LARGE 1000CS	\$ 19.40	0.019		1000		\$ 18.99		1000		\$ 24.95		
257	Gloves Disposable Vinyl Powder Free Extra large Sized	1000	CLEAR VINYL POWDER FREE GLOVES EXTRA LARGE 1000CS	\$ 19.40	0.019		1000		\$ 18.99		1000		\$ 24.95		
258	Sporkette Kit Regular PSKF1600 (Flat end milk straw kit)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				\$ 11.79		NO BID		\$ 16.55		
259	Cups 8 oz. Squat Foam	1000	VT8AXN FOAM SQUAT 8 OZ	\$ 31.10	0.031		1000		\$ 67.56		1000		\$ 61.68		
260	Lids 8 oz Squat	1000	FOAM LID 8OZ TVT8XN	\$ 20.99	0.021		1000		\$ 42.24		1000		\$ 38.95		
261	Food Tray #300	500	Food Tray, 3 lb_Shepherd's Check (Red)	\$ 29.05	0.058		500		\$ 25.04		500		\$ 19.55		
262	Wrap Foil 10.5X13 Teal Stripe	NB	NO BID	NB	NB		NB		\$ 86.19		NB		\$ 51.50		
263	Wiper Wypall X-50 Foodservice	150	97101 FOOD SERVICE WIPE	\$ 26.55	0.177		150		\$ 25.50		150		\$ 29.95		
264	Foil Roll Heavy 18X1M Kari-Out	500	18" x 500' Aluminum Foil Roll_Heavy Duty 1 ROLL	\$ 30.24	0.060		500		\$ 49.10		500		\$ 58.95		
265	Foil Roll Standard 18X1M Kari-Out	500	18" x 500' Aluminum Foil Roll	\$ 23.88	0.048		500		\$ 32.11		500		\$ 39.95		

Name of Vendor: Master List

SPEC No.		DESCRIPTION		Padre USA			Brady IFS				Fulton					
				PACK SIZE	UNIT	PRODUCT	CASE	UNIT	PACK SIZE	UNIT	CASE	UNIT	PACK SIZE	UNIT	CASE	UNIT
No.		DESCRIPTION		UNITS/CASE	SIZE	NAME	PRICE	PRICE	UNITS/CASE	SIZE	PRICE	PRICE	UNITS/CASE	SIZE	PRICE	PRICE
266		Bowl Styro 22 oz. Rice White Pactiv#TH10020	500	20oz Bagasse Take Out Bowl, Round, Natural	\$ 49.68	0.099			500		\$ 52.38		500		N/B	
267		PAK#CDL06S	500	Bagasse Flat Lid for 16-24 oz Bagasse Take Out Bowl, Round, Natural	\$ 60.65	0.121			500		\$ 54.76		500		N/B	
268		Liner Sheet Pan 16X24 Quilon P	1000	Coated Parchment Paper Bun / Sheet Pan Liner Sheet 16" x 24" - 1000/Case	\$ 57.22	0.057			1000		\$ 46.08		1000		\$ 49.92	
269		FoodHandler Pan Pals High-Heat Liner 34"X18" Item# PL3418	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID					\$ 83.08		NO BID		\$ 94.50	
270		Liner 45 GL HD 40S48 16MIC NAT	250	40 X 48 .16 MIC CLEAR PRE CUT	\$ 29.15	0.117			250		\$ 22.68		250		\$ 29.92	
271		Pactiv # 4071009 Insert for 4 oz cup PP 10/75ct	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID		\$ 45.13		NO BID		\$ 29.50	
272		Pactiv # 7473477 Lid Plas Clr 12/85ct	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID				NO BID		\$ 27.90	
273		Pactiv #7762026 Cup Plas Clr Pet 12-14 oz 10/70ct	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID				NO BID		\$ 55.45	
274		Pactiv #7474812 Cup Plas Clr Pet 16 oz 10/70ct	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID				NO BID		\$ 59.90	
275		Detergent Pot & Pan Pink Suds Accurate		NO BID							\$ 35.00				\$ 97.15	
276		Accu-Quat Accurate Sanitizer		NO BID							\$ 59.60				\$ 89.77	
277		Special Green Glisten Cleaner		NO BID							\$ 87.89				\$ 39.50	
278		Easy Clean Accurate Anti Slip Floor Cleaner		NO BID							\$ 28.38				\$ 98.11	

Legend
 Items that will be awarded together highlighted in gray.